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Researchers have suggested that sexual minority men are at increased risk for body image disturbance
relative to heterosexual men because of heightened focus on appearance within the gay community.
However, this research has often assumed sexual minority men endorse a monolithic body ideal, despite
evidence for different ideals within the gay community. The current survey research in a community-
based sample of 76 sexual minority men examined how the effect of identification with the gay
community on body image varied depending upon the body type of the participant and the form of body
image disturbance (i.e., desire to be smaller vs. desire for greater muscularity). For relatively heavier
sexual minority men, gay community identification was associated with less body dissatisfaction but
potentially more drive for muscularity. For relatively thinner sexual minority men, the pattern was
reversed. The results point to a need for a more nuanced examination of the role that varying body ideals
within the gay community may have on body image disturbance.
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The impact of gender on body image disturbance has been well
established: Women tend to suffer from greater levels of body
dissatisfaction compared to men (see Calogero & Thompson,
2010). On average, men are more satisfied with how they look and
are less behaviorally invested in their physical appearance than
women (Muth & Cash, 1997). However, many men do suffer from
body image disturbance, although their specific concerns may be
different from those affecting women. Men’s dissatisfaction with
their bodies is more likely to be expressed through a desire to be
both more muscular and lean (Olivardia, Pope, Borowiecki, &
Cohane, 2004) whereas women’s dissatisfaction tends to be char-
acterized by a drive for thinness. Pope, Phillips, and Olivardia
(2000) coined the term Adonis complex to capture the various
types of body image disturbance they witnessed in men. In par-
ticular, the Adonis complex tends to refer to men’s desire for the
visible and sculpted type of muscularity associated with images of
Adonis. In research with men from the United States, France, and
Austria, men chose an ideal body 28 pounds more muscular than
their current body on average (Pope et al., 2000).

Echoing these gender differences, whereas underweight women
tend to be satisfied with their slim appearances, both overweight as
well as underweight men report elevated dissatisfaction (Frederick,

Peplau, & Lever, 2006). Thus, unlike women, men falling at both
ends of the body size spectrum evidence heightened body image
disturbance (i.e., feeling either too thin or too heavy to meet the
male ideal). Although research on the effects of discrepancies
between actual and ideal body image among men is currently
lacking, some work does suggest differential effects of feeling
either too skinny or too large on men’s body image outcomes. In
a sample of adolescent boys, for example, dieting to lose weight
was associated with higher body dissatisfaction scores but dieting
to gain weight was associated with higher drive for muscularity
scores (McCreary & Sasse, 2002). These data suggest that for men,
the desire to be either thinner or more muscular may be associated
with unhealthy eating patterns. Indeed, body dissatisfaction among
men has a number of risky correlates, including low self-esteem,
depression, eating disorder symptoms (Olivardia et al., 2004), and
social anxiety (Cash, Theriault, & Annis, 2004).

Although women suffer from eating disorders at much higher
rates than men, sexual minority men make up a disproportionate
percentage of men in the United States who are diagnosed with
eating disorders (e.g., Carlat, Camargo, & Herzog, 1997; but see
Kane, 2010, for an alternate interpretation). Furthermore, evidence
suggests that sexual minority men suffer from body image distur-
bance at rates significantly higher than heterosexual men and
comparable to heterosexual women (e.g., Beren, Hayden, Wilfley,
& Grilo, 1996; Engeln-Maddox, Miller, & Doyle, 2011; Herzog,
Newman, Yeh, & Warshaw, 1992; Siever, 1994). One factor that
has been implicated in the literature on body image disturbance in
sexual minority men is identification with the gay community, a
community that has been described as highly focused on physical
appearance (Feldman & Meyer, 2007) and especially likely to
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endorse both a thin and muscular body ideal (Tiggemann, Martins,
& Kirkbride, 2007). Thus far, research on gay community identi-
fication and body image disturbance has been inconclusive. Re-
searchers have argued that sexual minority men with higher levels
of gay community identification compare themselves more often
to this culture’s slim, youthful ideal and experience higher rates of
eating disordered behavior (Feldman & Meyer, 2007) and greater
desire for muscularity (Levesque & Vichesky, 2006). This is in
contrast to research showing that for more general measures of
mental health and well-being, gay community identification ap-
pears to be a protective factor (e.g., Doyle & Molix, 2014).

A weakness of the literature on sexual minority men’s body
image is the frequent assumption that the gay male body ideal is
monolithic, despite converging lines of evidence that multiple,
highly divergent body ideals can be identified within groups of
sexual minority men (Bergling, 2006). Within the broader gay
community, sexual minority men often tend to socialize with
similar others, including those with similar body types (Forrest et
al., 2014; Hennen, 2005; Willoughby et al., 2008). Although
numerous different subgroups exist, two of the most prominent and
widely known are twinks and bears. Although these subgroups are
not entirely homogenous themselves, in general twinks tend to be
younger and have smaller frames, whereas bears tend to be hairier,
stockier, and more masculine acting (Waldron & Engeln-Maddox,
2011; Willoughby et al., 2008). Related to body ideals, Hennen
(2005) described the bear subculture (which emphasizes a heavier
ideal body size) as providing “an enticing antidote to the heart-
break of a slowing metabolism” (p. 25) and a chance to reject the
“body facism” (p. 27) espoused by the twink subculture (with its
emphasis on extremely thin, youthful bodies). Because members
of the gay community endorse various body ideals, it is possible
that gay community identification may represent a risk factor for
some sexual minority men and a protective factor for others.
Likewise, because body image disturbance in men often involves
not just a drive for thinness, but also a drive for muscularity, gay
community identification may differentially impact these variables
depending on the ideal toward which one is striving. For example,
a heavier man could find greater acceptance within the gay com-
munity, which rewards large, hypermasculine bodies, but this
focus could also trigger greater drive for muscularity. On the other
hand, a man dedicated to an extremely thin body ideal may find
worries about his amount of body fat exacerbated by identification
with the gay community, which also stresses a very thin body ideal
that is so difficult to obtain and keep. However, because of his
focus on the thin, youthful body ideal, this man may be relatively
free of pressures toward drive for muscularity.

Using survey methodology in a diverse, community-based sam-
ple of sexual minority men, the current study examined whether
body size moderated the association between gay community
identification and body image disturbance. First, we predicted that,
overall, higher BMI would be associated with higher levels of
fat-based body dissatisfaction and higher levels of drive for mus-
cularity. In addition, because sexual minority men may strive
toward either a slim and youthful body ideal or a heavier, hyper-
masculine body ideal, we predicted that body mass index (BMI)
would moderate the association between gay community identifi-
cation and body image disturbance. More specifically, we pre-
dicted that for very thin sexual minority men, gay community
identification would act as a risk factor for fat-based body dissat-

isfaction but as a protective factor for drive for muscularity. In
contrast, for heavier sexual minority men, we predicted that iden-
tification would act as a risk factor for drive for muscularity but be
associated with reduced fat-focused body dissatisfaction.

Methods

Participants and Procedure

All research procedures were reviewed and approved by the
local institutional review board. Informed consent was obtained
and all participants were fully debriefed upon conclusion of the
survey. Research assistants approached potential participants at
various locations in Chicago: the Chicago Pride Parade, an ele-
vated train stop, along a lakefront path, at a park and in the lobby
of a lesbian, gay, bisexual and transgender (LGBT) community
center during a LGBT-focused street fair. Participants were paid
$10 for completing anonymous surveys containing measures on a
variety of topics related to objectification, body image, and sexu-
ality. Because these data were collected as part of a larger research
project on objectification theory (Engeln-Maddox et al., 2011),
participants were recruited without regard to gender or sexual
orientation, although all participants were over 18 years of age. In
total, 76 sexual minority men participated in the current study.
Men were just under 30 years old on average (ranging from 18 to
56) with a mean annual household income between $40,000 and
$50,000. Although undergraduate students (19%) and graduate
students (15%) were included in the current sample, the majority
of participants were not currently students (66%). Because of a
clerical error, racial/ethnic identification was not assessed in the
current study. Therefore, although a relatively diverse community
sample was recruited for the current study, we cannot report racial
or ethnic group memberships for participants.

Participants identified their sexual orientation via a 7-point,
single-item measure of sexual orientation (Kinsey, Pomeroy, &
Martin, 1948), with responses ranging from 0 (exclusively hetero-
sexual with no homosexual contact) to 6 (exclusively homosexual
with no heterosexual contact). Consistent with research on the
varieties of sexual minority identities (Savin-Williams & Vranga-
lova, 2013), all men selecting scale points greater than 1 (predom-
inantly heterosexual, only incidentally homosexual contact) were
included in the current study. Of note, men who selected 2 (pre-
dominantly heterosexual, but more than incidentally homosexual
contact), 3 (equally heterosexual and homosexual contact), or 4
(predominantly homosexual, but more than incidentally heterosex-
ual contact) on this scale (sometimes used to identify bisexual
men) did not differ from men who selected 5 (predominantly
homosexual, only incidentally heterosexual contact) or 6 (exclu-
sively homosexual with no heterosexual contact) in mean level of
gay community identification, t(70) � .47, p � .64.

Measures

Body dissatisfaction. The Body Dissatisfaction subscale of
the Eating Disorders Inventory-2 (Garner, 1991) measures partic-
ipants’ dissatisfaction with the overall size and shape of regions of
the body. Participants respond to nine items assessing how often
they feel various body areas are too large on a scale ranging from
1 (always) to 6 (never). After reverse scoring appropriate items,
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participants were assigned 0 points for each item to which they
responded sometimes, rarely, or never; 1 point for often, 2 points
for usually, and 3 points for always (following the scoring recom-
mended by Garner, Olmstead, & Polivy, 1983, and Garner &
Garfinkel, 1979), with high scores indicating greater dissatisfac-
tion. This measure assesses feelings of fatness rather than worries
over lack of muscularity (e.g., “I think that my stomach is too
big”). Initial validity evidence for the EDI (and this subscale
specifically) was based on several large samples of patient and
nonpatient adolescents and adults (Garner, 1991). Scores on this
scale are positively correlated with other measures of body dissat-
isfaction and eating disorder symptoms (Garner, 1991; Spillane,
Boerner, Anderson, & Smith, 2004). Gay men tend to score higher
than heterosexual men on this subscale (Yelland & Tiggemann,
2003). Though this scale has been used more frequently with
women, psychometric analyses reveal factor invariance across
gender and similar invariant correlations with related measures
across gender (Spillane et al., 2004), suggesting it is an appropriate
measure to use with samples comprising men. Cronbach’s alpha
was .84 in the current sample.

Drive for muscularity. The Drive for Muscularity Scale
(McCreary & Sasse, 2000) is a 15-item measure of attitudes and
behaviors related to the motivation to increase one’s muscular-
ity (e.g., I think I would look better if I gained 10 pounds in
bulk). The response scale was identical to that of the body
dissatisfaction scale described above; total scores are the mean
of responses to all items after reverse scoring appropriate items.
The Drive for Muscularity Scale has been identified as a highly
effective measure of male body image (Cafri & Thompson,
2004). Among samples of adolescent boys, scores on this mea-
sure were associated with dieting to gain weight (McCreary &
Sasse, 2002), low self-esteem and depression (McCreary &
Sasse, 2000). An alpha of .91 was found for a sample of college
men (Davis, Karvinen, & McCreary, 2005) and .89 for a sample
of men ranging in age from 18 – 64 (Sladek, Engeln, & Miller,
2014). Cronbach’s alpha in the current sample was .86.

Gay community identification. This seven-item scale (Tiggemann
et al., 2007) assesses overall amounts of contact with the gay
community (e.g., I am actively involved in the gay and lesbian
community). Responses are made on a scale ranging from 1 (not at
all true of me) to 7 (extremely true of me), with higher scores
indicating greater identification with the gay community. Though
little validity evidence is available for this scale, in a sample of 253
adult men, scores were not associated with self-esteem or age
(Tiggemann et al., 2007). Cronbach’s alpha in the current sample
was .72.

Results

First, BMI was computed from height and weight data according
to the standard formula (mass in kilograms divided by height in
meters squared). Next, data were screened. All variables evidenced
normality except BMI. Further investigation revealed the lack of
normality was due to four participants whose BMIs were substan-
tial outliers (greater than 2 SDs above the sample mean). Exclud-
ing these participants (or, alternatively, Winsorizing their scores
on this variable) resolved the lack of normality but did not change
the pattern or statistical significance of any of the following
analyses, thus their original data are included in this report. Table

1 displays descriptive statistics and intercorrelations for key vari-
ables. Age was not related to either measure of body image
disturbance; however it was associated with gay community iden-
tification and was thus included as a covariate in the following
analyses. Of note, body dissatisfaction was not significantly cor-
related with drive for muscularity, r � .10, p � .40, suggesting that
these body image concerns were relatively independent among
sexual minority men in the current study.

To examine whether the association between gay community
identification and body image disturbance differed by level of
BMI, we followed steps outlined by Frazier, Tix, and Barron
(2004) to test for moderation. We conducted two separate hierar-
chical multiple regression analyses, entering body dissatisfaction
and drive for muscularity as the dependent variables in these two
analyses. For both models, age was entered as a covariate on the
first step. The second step included gay community identification
and BMI (both grand mean-centered) as predictors. The interaction
between gay community identification and BMI was entered on
the final step.

When predicting body dissatisfaction, on the second step of the
analysis BMI emerged as a significant predictor, B � .55, SE �
.15, p � .001, but not gay community identification, B � �.06,
SE � .59, p � .92. Higher levels of BMI among sexual minority
men were associated with greater body dissatisfaction on average.
However, this main effect was qualified by the hypothesized
interaction between BMI and gay community identification on the
third step, B � �.40, SE � .16, p � .02 (total R2 � .27, �R2 �
.08 for the third step).

To break down the interaction between gay community identi-
fication and BMI predicting body dissatisfaction, we computed
simple slopes (Aiken & West, 1991) for the relationship between
gay community identification and body dissatisfaction for those
with relatively higher BMIs (�1 SD) and those with relatively
lower BMIs (�1 SD). These slopes are plotted in Figure 1. As
hypothesized, among sexual minority men with relatively higher
BMIs, identification with the gay community predicted decreased
levels of body dissatisfaction, � � �.52, p � .03. However,
among gay men with relatively lower BMIs, identification with the
gay community was marginally associated with greater levels of
body dissatisfaction, � � .28, p � .09. It should be noted that
observed power for the overall model was .53, whereas observed
power for the interaction term was .40. Therefore, these results,
including tests of specific simple slopes, should be interpreted with
some caution due to low power.

Table 1
Descriptive Statistics and Intercorrelations Among
Study Variables

Variable 1 2 3 4 5

M 29.73 24.97 4.19 7.75 3.94
SD 10.82 4.97 1.39 6.89 0.88
1. Age —
2. Body mass index 0.10 —
3. Gay community identification �0.26� 0.11 —
4. Body dissatisfaction �0.05 0.41�� �0.01 —
5. Drive for muscularity �0.04 0.31�� �0.04 �0.10 —

N � 76.
� p � .05. �� p � .01.
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In the parallel model predicting drive for muscularity, on the
second step of the analysis gay community identification was not
a significant predictor, B � �.07, SE � .08, p � .37, but BMI was
a significant predictor, B � �.06, SE � .02, p � .01. Similar to the
previous model, higher levels of BMI among sexual minority men
were associated with greater drive for muscularity. However, this
main effect was once again qualified by a significant interaction on
the third step, B � �.05, SE � .02, p � .03 (total R2 � .18, �R2 �
.06 for the third step).

Next, we examined the interaction between gay community
identification and BMI predicting drive for muscularity. Again we
computed simple slopes (Aiken & West, 1991), this time for the
relationship between gay community identification and drive for
muscularity for those with relatively higher BMIs (�1 SD) and
those with relatively lower BMIs (�1 SD), which are plotted in
Figure 1. Among sexual minority men with relatively higher
BMIs, identification with the gay community was not significantly
associated with drive for muscularity, � � .35, p � .16 (although
the trend was toward an inverse association). As hypothesized,
however, among sexual minority men with relatively lower BMIs,
identification with the gay community was associated with lesser
drive for muscularity, � � �.39, p � .03. Once again, observed

power was low for the overall model (.44) as well as for the
interaction term (.30), and effects should be interpreted with some
caution.

Discussion

In the current research, it was found that BMI moderated the
association between gay community identification and body image
disturbance (both body dissatisfaction and drive for muscularity)
among sexual minority men. Phrased in another manner, gay
community identification was associated with different body im-
age concerns for heavier compared to thinner sexual minority men.
Analyses of simple slopes revealed that gay community identifi-
cation was associated with lesser body dissatisfaction for relatively
heavier men and with marginally greater body dissatisfaction but
lesser drive for muscularity for relatively thinner men. Overall,
these models explained a substantial proportion of the variance in
body dissatisfaction and drive for muscularity in the current study
(approximately 27% and 18%, respectively).

These results highlight the importance of considering body type
when evaluating the association between gay community identifi-
cation and body image. Though higher BMI was associated with

Figure 1. Interaction between gay community identification (ID) and body mass index (BMI) predicting body
dissatisfaction (a) and drive for muscularity (b).
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greater body dissatisfaction and greater drive for muscularity on
average, both of these main effects of BMI were qualified by
significant interactions with gay community identification. Specif-
ically, gay community identification was associated with lesser
concern over being too fat among gay men with relatively higher
BMIs (i.e., community identification acted as a protective factor).
Although this might seem counterintuitive, the finding is in line
with the notion that body ideals among the gay community vary.
However, there was also a nonsignificant trend for heavier sexual
minority men with greater levels of gay community identification
to report greater drive for muscularity (suggesting a potential risk
factor). The reverse pattern emerged for relatively thinner sexual
minority men. For these men, gay community identification was
associated with lesser drive for muscularity (i.e., a protective
factor), but marginally greater (thinness-focused) body dissatisfac-
tion (i.e., a risk factor).

Despite previous assumptions made in the literature on sexual
minority men’s body image concerning the ideal body type es-
poused by the gay community, a potential explanation for the
results observed in the current study is that sexual minority men
may place value on substantially different body types (Hennen,
2005). For example, heavier or stockier sexual minority men may
identify with other men who also value a larger and more muscular
figure, whereas thinner sexual minority men may identify with
those who value the slim ideal that is often seen as the archetype
of gay male attractiveness. Consideration of these differences is
crucial to elucidating the mechanisms whereby gay community
identification influences body image disturbance and consequent
mental health. Furthermore, some of the inconsistencies in the
current literature on sexual minority men’s body image might be
resolved by examining these factors. Given the links between
men’s body image and several types of mental health risks (de-
pression, anxiety, eating disorders), clinicians treating gay men
should take care to assess for an unhealthy focus on both thinness
and/or muscularity in their patients. Those working with gay men
with eating concerns should be aware of how involvement with the
gay community may affect these concerns in different ways for
different types of men.

One limitation of the current work is our reliance on BMI as a
proxy for body type. Although BMI is a convenient and generally
effective measure of body composition, it does not tap into more
subtle differences revealed by bioelectrical impedance, skinfold
measures, or other gauges of percent body fat. Furthermore, we did
not ask participants to describe specific subgroups within the gay
community (e.g., twinks, bears) that were most relevant to their
identification but relied on the same general measure of identifi-
cation for all participants.1 Participants in the current study also
tended to be younger adults (the oldest participant identified as
56); therefore it is important for future work to examine whether
these associations function similarly among older sexual minority
men as well. Another limitation of the current study was the
relatively small sample size and resultant low power to detect
significant effects. Despite this limitation, and general difficulties
when attempting to detect moderated effects in nonexperimental
studies (Frazier et al., 2004), we found parallel interactions be-
tween gay community identification and BMI predicting both body
dissatisfaction and drive or muscularity. These significant results
support the importance of considering differences in body type
when conducting research with sexual minority men concerning

community identification and body image. However, the relatively
low statistical power of the current study may have limited the
ability to detect significant simple slopes when decomposing these
interactions. Finally, the self-report, cross-sectional nature of this
work allows us to describe associations between variables but not
to verify the accuracy of reports or infer causation.

Despite these limitations, the observed results contribute to the
extant literature on sexual minority men’s body image and point
toward an important path for future work. Only by considering the
diversity of body-related values and norms within the gay com-
munity can researchers begin to understand how identification
influences body image disturbance. As seen in the current study,
gay community identification may serve as both a risk factor and
a protective factor, potentially operating in different ways for
sexual minority men based on other characteristics, such as BMI.
Rather than relying upon a one-size-fits-all strategy, researchers
and community groups should work together to design effective
interventions that both reduce extant risk factors and bolster extant
protective factors to attenuate the number of sexual minority men
suffering from body image disturbance and eating disordered
behaviors.

1 Although the current study did not assess subgroup identification, data
from a similar study (Waldron & Engeln-Maddox, 2011) with gay male
participants in the Chicago area revealed significant subgroup differences
in BMI, t(36) � �4.61, p � .001, d � 1.54, with self-identified twinks
reporting significantly lower BMIs (M � 21.70, SD � 3.96) compared to
self-identified bears (M � 29.31, SD � 5.78), supporting a subgroup
identification hypothesis.
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